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The following disciplinary information exists for the professional selected:

Name:
O'Shaughnessy, Gary

Profession:
Osteopathic
Physician

Lic #:
682

ACTION REASON
EFFECTIVE

DATE
License reprimanded; must meet certain terms and
conditions; assessed $2,000 civil penalty, plus costs

Unprofessional, dishonorable or unethical conduct;
habitual intoxication or personal misuse of any
drugs or the use of intoxicating liquors, narcotics,
controlled substances or other drugs or stimulants in
such a manner as to adversely affect the person’s
ability to practice medicine; dispensing, prescribing
or otherwise distributing any controlled substance
or any other drug not in the course of professional
practice, or not in good faith to relieve pain and
suffering or not to cure an ailment, physical
infirmity or disease; dispensing, prescribing or
otherwise distributing to any person a controlled
substance or other drug if such person is addicted to
the habit of using controlled substances without
making a bona fide effort to cure the habit of such
patient; dispensing, prescribing or otherwise
distributing to any person a controlled substance or
other drug to a person in violation of any law of the
state or the United States

8/15/2012 
View Board Order

License surrendered; must meet certain terms and
conditions before reapplying for licensure; assessed
costs

Violation or attempted violation, directly or
indirectly, or assisting in or abetting the violation
of, or conspiring to violate, any provision of this
chapter or any lawful order of the board issued
pursuant thereto or any criminal statute of the state
of Tennessee

5/15/2013 
View Board Order

 


